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Dear PIcc Alliance

We are pleased to announce a special event, Evaluating Medical Imaging
Devices and Image-Based Algorithms with the Clinician In The Loop, a
tutorial on reader study designs and multi-reader, multi-case (MRMC) analysis
presented by Brandon Gallas, PhD (FDA/CDRH/OSEL/DIDSR). Join us on 

Friday, August 5, 2022 at 12:00 - 1:00 PM Eastern Time.

This is a virtual presentation open to all PIcc members and the public. Please
share with your statistics colleagues. 

Add event to calendar
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This talk will present the major elements to design, execute, and analyze
reader studies. In a reader study, clinicians perform an objective task given
medical images. The purpose of a reader study is to assess the clinicians’
performance doing the task given the images or to compare performance given
images from a new technology to the performance given images from the
reference technology. The clinician is part of the technology assessment. The
clinicians are the readers and the medical images are the cases.  Of course,
there is bias and variability from human evaluations. As such, analysis methods
for reader performance (variance estimates, confidence intervals, hypothesis
tests) need to account for the bias and variability from the readers while they
also account for the variability from the cases. Such an analysis is referred to
as a multi-reader, multi-case (MRMC) analysis. An MRMC analysis can
summarize average reader performance that is expected to generalize to the
population of readers and the population of cases.

This talk has been given as training for medical imaging and image-based
AI/ML device reviewers in the Center for Diagnostics and Radiological
Health at the FDA.

Please reach out to digipathalliance@gmail.com with any questions or
inquiries. Thank you.
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